
CITY OF OROVILLE

ORDINANCE NO. 1840

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF OROVILLE,
ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE 2019 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA CODE

OF REGULATIONS TITLE 24, KNOWN AS THE CALIFORNIA BUILDING
STANDARDS CODE PARTS 1-6 AND 8-12 AND THE UNIFORM HOUSING

CODE 1997 EDITION, AND THE UNIFORM CODE FOR THE ABATEMENT OF
DANGEROUS BUILDINGS 1997 EDITION AND THE 2019 EDITION OF THE

INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE AND AMENDING

CERTAIN PORTIONS OF THE CALIFORNIA CODE OF REGULATIONS

TITLE 24

NOW, THEREFORE, the Oroville City Council DO ORDAIN as follows:

WHEREAS, The purpose of this Chapter is to adopt by reference the 2019 edition of
the California Code of Regulations Title 24, known as the California Building
Standards Code Parts 1-6 and 8-12, subject to the definitions, clarifications, and
the amendments set forth in this Chapter. The purpose of this Chapter is also to
provide minimum requirements and standards for the protection of the public
safety, health, property, and welfare of the City of Oroville. This Chapter is
adopted under the authority of Government Code Subsection 50022.2, Health and
Safety Code Section 18941.5, and the California Constitution.

Section 1. Chapter 15-04 of the City of Oroville Municipal Code (General
Applications)

A. The existing sections of Chapter 15 Division 1 of the city of Oroville
Municipal Code that are not expressly repealed or amended by this ordinance are
hereby readopted without change, and shall apply, as applicable, to the model
codes herein adopted.

B. The following sections and subsections of Chapter 18-04 of the Santa Rosa
City Code are amended as follows:

Division I. Uniform Codes

Chapter 15.04 GENERAL APPLICATIONS AND ADMINISTRATIVE CODE

15.04.010 Title and purpose.

A. This chapter shall be known as the Oroville Building Code, and may be cited as such, and
will be referred to herein as "this Code."



B. The purpose of this Code is to provide for the uniform administration and enforcement of
the technical codes adopted by this jurisdiction. (Ord. 1800 § 2, 2013)

15.04.020 Conflicts with other laws or ordinances.

In the event of any conflict between this Code and any law, rule or regulation of the State of

California, that requirement which establishes the higher standard of safety shall govern. (Ord.
1800 §2,2013)

15.04.030 Adoption of the Administrative Code.

A. Chapter 1, Divisions I and II of the 2013 Edition of the California Building Code, Title 24,
Part 2 of the California Code of Regulations hereinafter referred to as "Administrative Building
Code," as amended, is hereby adopted and incorporated by reference herein.

B. Exception. Chapter 1 Division I and sections referenced therein of Chapter 1 Division II of
the 2013 Edition of the California Residential Code, Title 24, Part 2.5, as amended in Section

15.04.080, hereinafter referred to as the "Administrative Residential Code," is hereby adopted as

amended and incorporated by reference herein and shall govern buildings as applicable per

Residential Code Section 1.1.3. (Ord. 1800 § 2,2013)

15.04.040 Flood ordinance compliance.

The city flood ordinance. Chapter 15.96, applies to buildings constructed in areas regulated

therein. (Ord. 1800 §2,2013)

15.04.050 Scope.

A. The provisions of the Administrative Residential Code shall serve as the administrative,

organizational, and enforcement rules and regulations for the technical codes that regulate, within
this jurisdiction, the site preparation, construction, alteration, movement, enlargement,
replacement, repair, equipment, use and occupancy, location, maintenance, removal and

demolition of every detached one- and two-family dwelling and accessory structures as classified
in Section 1.1.3 of the Residential Code.

B. The provisions of the Administrative Building Code shall serve as the administrative,

organizational, and enforcement rules and regulations for the technical codes that regulate, within
this jurisdiction, the site preparation, construction, alteration, movement, enlargement,
replacement, repair, equipment, use and occupancy, location, removal and demolition of every
building or structure including but not limited to docks, marinas, boathouses, signs, swimming
pools, accessory structures or any appurtenances connected or attached to such buildings or
structures and building service equipment within this jurisdiction unless these are subject to
regulation under the Residential Code. (Ord. 1800 § 2, 2013)

15.04.060 Deflnitions.

For the purpose of this chapter, the following definitions shall apply:



Whenever the word "code" is used in California Chapter 1 of the California Building Code, Title
24, Part 2, of the California Code of Regulations, it shall mean the Administrative Code.

"Building official" is the officer or other designated authority charged with the administration,
and enforcement of the Code. The terms "administrative authority," and "city" are to be
considered synonymous with the terms "building official," "department of building safety" and
"building department" as they appear in the Code or the technical codes.

"Building service equipment" refers to the plumbing, mechanical, and electrical equipment
including piping, wiring, fixtures, and other accessories that provide sanitation, lighting, heating,
ventilation, cooling, refrigeration and fire fighting facilities essential for the habitable occupancy
of the building or structure for its designated use and occupancy.

"This jurisdiction" means the incorporated area of the City of Oroville.

"Technical codes" refers to the following codes adopted by the City of Oroville, which contain
the provisions for design, construction, alteration, addition, repair, removal, demolition, use,
location and occupancy of all buildings and structures and building service equipment as herein
defined:

1. Oroville City Code, Chapter 15.08, Building Code (hereinafter referred to as "Building
Code").

2. Oroville City Code, Chapter 15.12, Residential Code (hereinafter referred to as "Residential

Code").

3. Oroville City Code, Chapter 15.24, Plumbing Code (hereinafter referred to as "Plumbing
Code").

4. Oroville City Code, Chapter 15.28, Electrical Code (hereinafter referred to as "Electrical

Code").

5. Oroville City Code, Chapter 15.32, Energy Code (hereinafter referred to as "Energy Code").

6. Oroville City Code, Chapter 15.40, Mechanical Code (hereinafter referred to as "Mechanical

Code").

7. Oroville City Code, Chapter 15.60, Fire Code (hereinafter referred to as "Fire Code").

8. Oroville City Code, Chapter 15.56, California Green Building Standards Code (hereinafter

referred to as "Green Code"). (Ord. 1800 § 2, 2013)

15.04.070 Amendments to Sections 103 and 105 through 116 of Chapter 1, Division 11, of the Building
Code.

A. Section 103.1 "Creation of enforcement agency" is amended as follows:

103.1 Creation of Enforcement Agency. The Building Inspection section of the Construction

Management and Inspection Division is hereby created and the official in charge thereof shall be
known as the building official.

B. Section 105.3.2 "Time Limitation of Application" is re-titled and amended as follows:

105.3.2 Expiration of Plan Review. Applications for which no permit is issued within 180 days
following the date of application shall expire by limitation, and plans and other data submitted for
review may thereafter be returned to the applicant or destroyed by the building official. The
building official may extend time for action by the applicant for a period not exceeding 180 days



upon request by the applicant in writing showing that circumstances beyond the control of the

applicant have prevented action from being taken. No application shall be extended more than
twice. In order to renew action on an application after expiration, the applicant shall resubmit

plans and pay a new plan review fee.

C. Section 105.5 "Expiration" is re-titled and amended as follows:

105.5 Permit Expiration. Every permit issued by the building official under the provisions of
the technical codes shall expire by limitation and become null and void if the building or work
authorized by such permit is not commenced within 180 days from the date of such permit or if

the building or work authorized by such permit is suspended or abandoned for a period of 180
days at any time after the work is commenced. Before such work can be recommenced, the permit
shall be renewed. The fee for renewal shall be one-half the amount required for a new permit for
such work, provided no changes have been made or will be made in the original plans and
specifications for such work, and provided further that such suspension or abandonment has not
exceeded one year. In order to renew action on a permit after the building or work has been

suspended or abandoned or the permit has been expired for a period exceeding one year, the
permittee shall pay a new full permit fee. Permits deemed to have expired shall be subject to all
permit related fee increases and new fees in effect at the time of permit renewal as applicable

subject to the discretion of the building official. The valuation for new construction or additions
shall not be less than that established by the International Code Council based square footage cost

tables. The building official shall have discretion to adjust permit renewal fees when extenuating

circumstances exist.

Permits will be deemed to have expired if there has been no inspection of work within a 180-day
period. When the work is not ready for a required inspection within 180 days of the last

inspection, the permittee must request a permit extension.

Any permittee holding an unexpired permit may apply for an extension of the time within which

work may commence under that permit when the permittee is unable to commence work within
the time required by this section for good and satisfactory reasons. The building official may
extend the time for action by the permittee showing that circumstances beyond the control of the
permittee have prevented action from being taken. No permit shall be extended more than once.

All building permits shall expire two years after the issuance date. The permit may be extended
beyond this period if the work authorized by the permit is being diligently pursued but only upon
written request by the permittee. Review of the request and granting of an approved time
extension beyond two years shall be made by the building official.

D. Section 109.1.1 "Fees" is added as follows:

109.1.1 Fees. The fee for each permit shall be that fee established by the City Council fee
resolution.

E. Section 109.1.2 "Plan Review Fees" is added as follows:

109.1.2 Plan Review Fees. When submittal construction documents are required by Section 107,
a plan review fee shall be paid at the time of submitting the submittal documents for plan review.
Said plan review fee shall be that fee established by the City Council fee resolution.

The plan review fees specified in this section are separate fees from the permit fees specified in
Section 109.1.1 and are in addition to the permit fees. When submittal documents are incomplete
or changed so as to require additional plan review, or when project involves a deferred submittal



item as defined in Section 107.3.4.1, an additional plan review fee shall be charged at the rate
established by the City Council fee resolution.

F. Section 109.3 "Building Permit Valuations" is amended as follows:

109.3 Building Permit Valuations. The applicant for a permit shall provide an estimated permit
value at time of application. The value to be used in computing the building permit and building
plan review fees shall be the total of all construction work for which the permit is being issued, as
well as finish work, painting, roofing, electrical, plumbing, gas, heating, air conditioning,
elevators, fire extinguishing systems, and any other permanent equipment and systems. Value for
donated and/or discounted materials and labor shall be established at typical market value and
rates. The permit shall include additional valuation for work on the project site such as lighting,
sewer, water service and other items requiring inspection. In no case shall the valuation for new
construction or additions be less than determined by the International Code Council based cost
tables. When permitted work includes an alteration to an existing structure, or includes work
outside of the standard calculated fee areas determined by the International Code Council based

square footage cost tables, the applicant shall provide actual/contracted project costs to establish
the additional non-calculated valuation of the total permitted project. If, in the opinion of the
building official, the valuation is underestimated on the application, the permit shall be denied
unless the applicant can show detailed estimates to meet the approval of the building official.
Final building permit valuation shall be set by the building official.

G. Section 109.4 "Work Commencing Before Permit Issuance" is amended as follows:

109.4 Work Commencing Before Permit Issuance. Any person who commences any work on a

building, structure, electrical, gas, mechanical, plumbing system before obtaining the necessary
permits shall be subject to a violation fee. The violation fee shall be twice the amount of the total
Building Inspection fees (plan review plus building permit fees) as established by the City
Council fee resolution. The violation fee is separate and independent from other fees and shall be
collected whether or not a permit is then or subsequently issued; however, the violation fee shall
not apply to emergency work when it is proved to the satisfaction of the building official that

such work was urgently necessary and that it was not practical to obtain a permit before

commencement of the work. The payment of such violation fee shall not exempt any person from
compliance with other provisions of this Code, the technical codes, or from any penalty

prescribed by law.

H. Section 109.6 "Refunds" is amended as follows:

109.6 Refunds. The building official may authorize the refunding of any fee paid hereunder that

was erroneously paid or collected.

The building official may authorize the refund of the separate plan review and/or building permit

fees. The plan review fee may be refunded when no plan review has been performed. The
building permit fee may be refunded only when inspections have not been provided. The refund
of these separate and independent fees shall not exceed 80% of the individual plan review or
building permit fee.

The building official shall not authorize the refunding of any fee paid except upon written
application filed by the original applicant not later than 180 days after the date of fee payment.
Under no circumstances shall there be a refund of either fee if the plan review or building permit
has expired.



I. Section 110.7 "Reinspections" is added as follows:

110.7 Reinspections. A reinspection fee may be assessed for each inspection or reinspection when

any of the following conditions exist:

1. such portion of work for which inspection is called is not completely ready.

2. previous written corrections have not been made.

3. the job address is not clearly posted and visible from the street or the front of the building.

4. the inspector has no access to the work to be inspected.

5. the approved plans are not readily available to the inspector.

6. the building permit, application and any previous correction notice(s) are not available at the

job site.

7. deviating from the approved plans requiring further approval of the building official.

This section is not to be interpreted as requiring reinspection fees the first time a job is rejected
for failure to comply with the requirements of this Code, but as controlling the practice of calling

for inspections before the job is completely ready for such inspection or when plans and/or permit

documents are not available to the inspector at the site where the inspection is to be performed.

To obtain a reinspection, the applicant shall file an application in writing on a form furnished for
that purpose and pay the reinspection fee as established by the City Council fee resolution.

In instances where reinspection fees have been assessed, no additional inspection of the work will
be performed until the reinspection fees have been paid.

J. Section 112.1 "Connection of Service Utilities" is amended as follows:

112.1 Connection of Service Utilities. No person shall make connections from a source of energy
fuel, or power to any building service equipment that is regulated by the technical codes and for
which a permit is required by this Code until approved by the building official.

K. Section 112.1.1 "Connection of Building Service Equipment" is added as follows:

112.1.1 Connection of Building Service Equipment. All building service equipment for which a
permit is required by this Code shall be inspected by the building official. No portion of any
building service equipment intended to be concealed by any permanent portion of the building
shall be concealed until inspected and approved. When the installation of any building service
equipment is complete, an additional and final inspection shall be made. Building service
equipment regulated by the technical codes shall not be connected to the water, fuel, or power
supply or sewer system until authorized by the building official.

L. Section 112.1.2 "Operation of Building Service Equipment" is added as follows:

112.1.2 Operation of Building Service Equipment. Inspection of replacement building service
equipment must be scheduled within 48 hours after installation; building service equipment
replaced on an emergency basis may be operated during this time. No work may be covered prior
to approval of the building official.

M. Section 112.2 "Temporary Connection" is amended as follows:

112.2 Temporary Connection. The building official may authorize the temporary connection of
the building service equipment to the source of energy fuel, or power for the purpose of testing
building service equipment or for the use under a temporary Certificate of Occupancy.



N. Section 112.3 "Authority to Disconnect Service Utilities" is amended as follows:

112.3 Authority to Disconnect Service Utilities. The building official or an authorized

representative shall have the authority to disconnect any utility service or energy supplied to any
building, structure, or building service equipment therein regulated by this Code or the technical
codes when either:

1. The building owner/occupant knowingly fails to comply with a notice or order.

2. In case of emergency where necessary to eliminate an immediate hazard to life or property.

The building official shall, whenever possible, notify the serving utility, the owner and the
occupant of the building, structure, or building service equipment of the decision to disconnect
prior to taking such action and shall notify such serving utility, owner, and occupant of the
building structure, or building service equipment, in writing, of such disconnection immediately
thereafter.

O. Section 113 "Board of Appeals" is amended and added as follows:

113.1 General (amended).

The appeal process is only for review of the jurisdictional interpretation of the technical building
codes and does not apply to the adopted jurisdictional administrative section of the code.

In order to hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions, or determinations made by the building
official relative to the application and interpretation of the technical codes, there shall be and is
hereby created a building inspection board of appeals. The board of appeals Chairperson and Vice
Chairperson shall be appointed by the building official and approved by the City Council and
shall hold office at its pleasure. The Board of Appeals shall adopt rules of procedure for
conducting its business.

113.1.1 Informal Appeal (added).

Prior to the convening of a formal session of appeals before this board, an informal appeal shall
be convened for review and determination of the issue by the building official and building
inspection personnel who possess the specific inspection discipline expertise. Discipline trade or
engineering and construction experts may also participate in this first step appeal. This appeal
request must be made to the building official in writing. Should the appellant disagree with the
interpretation by the informal board of appeals, a written request for the formal appeals process
may be made.

113.1.2 Appeals in Violation Cases (added).

For violation cases, the informal appeal process shall be used to appeal issued notices and orders.
This appeal request must be made to the building official in writing within ten calendar days of
the issuance date of the notice or order. Violation case notices and orders shall not be elevated to

the second level formal Board of Appeals which is reserved for technical provisions of the Code.

113.2 Limitations on authority (amended).

An application for appeal shall be based on a claim that the true intent of the technical codes or

the rules legally adopted hereunder have been incorrectly interpreted, the provisions of the
technical codes do not fully apply, or an equally good or better form of construction is proposed.
The board shall have no authority to waive the requirements of the technical codes.

113.3 Qualifications and Members (amended).



The board of appeals shall consist of a Chairperson, a Vice Chairperson approved by the City
Council who will be present at each appeal and three listed experts that are familiar with the

content subject of the specific appeal. The Chairperson and Vice Chair shall be chosen from the
Architectural, Building Code and/or Legal (Attorney) professions. The additional three members
shall be chosen from a list to meet the needs of each specific appeal. Chosen members shall
possess the experience and training to pass on matters pertaining to building construction.

Appointments shall not be employees of the Jurisdiction for the specific appeal at hand and shall
consist of members who are qualified and specifically knowledgeable in the California Building
Standards Code and applicable local ordinances.

The board of appeals shall consist of five members, three of which are chosen to serve based

upon their expertise and availability for any single appeal matter. The Chairperson and Vice
Chairperson of the board shall be approved by the City Council and shall be present at each
appeal. A list of available members shall be reviewed by the building official and appointed
through agreement of the Chairperson and Vice Chairperson for membership. These two primary
members shall further choose the member experts for each appeal request. The list of potential
board members shall be derived from a typical group of representative experts such as:
Residential or Commercial General Contractors; Electrical contractors; Mechanical contractors;

Plumbing contractors; Electrical engineers; Mechanical engineers; Civil or structural engineers;
Architect; Fire service representative; Attorney; Utility representative; and a Code
expert/professional from outside of the jurisdiction.

113.5 Terms (added).

Terms for Chairperson and Vice Chairperson shall be for three years or for the length of the
current California Code cycle. Other listed members shall be chosen and appointed to individual
appeal board sessions at the pleasure of the Chairperson and Vice Chairperson. There is no limit
in the number of terms that any board member may serve.

113.6 Vacancies (added).

Vacancies for the Chairperson and Vice Chairperson shall be filled and appointment by the
building official for the un-expired portion of the term.

113.7 Secretary (added).

The secretary shall be the building official or designee. The secretary shall have no vote except in
the case of a tie vote.

113.8 Meetings (added).

The Board of Appeals shall meet as determined by the building official or as determined by the
Chairperson and/or by the Vice Chairperson of the board.

113.9 Rules, Regulations, Decisions and Findings (added).

The Board of Appeals shall adopt reasonable rules and regulations for conducting its
investigations. The Board of Appeals shall render all decisions and findings in writing to the
building official and provide a copy to the applicant; the Board of Appeals may recommend to the
City Council or jurisdictional governing board such new legislation as is consistent therewith.
Decisions and findings are final and shall be filed in the office of the building official, for public
inspection.

P. Section 114.5 "Authority to Condemn Building Service Equipment" is added as follows:



114.5 Authority to Condemn Building Service Equipment. Whenever the building official

determines that any building service equipment regulated in the technical codes has become

hazardous to life, health, property or becomes unsanitary, the building official shall order, in
writing, that such equipment either be removed or restored to a safe or sanitary condition,
whichever is appropriate. The written notice itself shall prescribe a fixed time limit for

compliance with such order. No person shall use or maintain defective building service
equipment after receiving such notice.

When such equipment or installation is to be disconnected, a written notice of such disconnection
and causes therefore shall be given within 24 hours to the serving utility, the owner, and occupant

of such building, structure or premises.

When any building service equipment is maintained in violation of the technical codes and in
violation of any notice issued pursuant to the provisions of this section, the building official shall
institute any appropriate action to prevent, restrain, correct or abate the violation.

Q. Section 114.6 "Connection after Order to Disconnect" is added as follows:

114.6 Connection after Order to Disconnect. No person shall make connections to any energy,
fuel, or power supply nor supply energy or fuel to any building service equipment that has been
disconnected, ordered to be disconnected or the use of which has been ordered discontinued by

the building official until the building official authorizes the reconnection and use of .such
equipment.

The building official shall have the right to withhold clearing building service equipment for

connection by the utility company if the owner or contractor refuses to comply with other

ordinances affecting the structure as a whole.

(Ord. 1800 §2,2013)

15.04.080 Amendments to Sections R103 and R105 through R116 of Chapter I, Division II, of the
Residential Code.

A. Section R103.1 "Creation of enforcement agency." Refer to Section 15.04.070, Section
103.1.

B. Section R105.3.1.1 "Determination of substantially improved or substantially damaged

existing buildings in flood hazard areas" is specifically not adopted. In lieu of Section R105.3.1.1,
refer to the City of Oroville flood ordinance. Chapter 15.96.

C. Section R105.3.2 "Time limitation of application." Refer to Section 15.04.070, Section
105.3.2.

D. Section R105.5 "Expiration." Refer to Section 15.04.070, Section 105.5.

E. Section R108.1.1 "Fees" is hereby added; refer to Section 15.04.070, Section 109.1.1.

P. Section R108.1.2 "Plan Review Fees" is hereby added; refer to Section 15.04.070,

Subsection 109.1.2.

G. Section R108.1.3 "Additional Plan Review" is added as follows:

For projects where changes in the scope of work require additional plan review, additional plan
review fees shall be charged at the rate prescribed in Section 15.04.070 of the Oroville City Code.

H. Section R 108.3 "Building Permit Valuations." Refer to Section 15.04.070, Section 109.3.



I. Section R108.6 "Work Commencing Before Permit Issuance." Refer to Section 15.04.070,

Section 109.4.

J. Section R108.5 "Refunds." Refer to Section 15.04.070, Section 109.6.

K. Section R109.1.6.1 "Elevation documentation" is specifically not adopted. In lieu of Section
R109.1.6.1, refer to the City of Oroville flood ordinance. Chapter 15,96,

L. Section R109.5 "Reinspections" is hereby added; refer to Section 15.04.070, Section 110.7.

M. Section R110.1 "Certificate of Occupancy" is amended as follows:

Exception 3. The record of approved final inspections serves as approval of occupancy for R3
occupancies and accessory structures.

N. Section R111.1 "Connection of Service Utilities." Refer to Section 15.04.070, Section 112.1.

O. Section R111.1.1 "Connection of Building Service Equipment" is hereby added; refer to
Section 15.04.070, Section 112.1.1.

P. Section R111.1.2 "Operation of Building Service Equipment" is hereby added; refer to
Section 15.04.070, Section 112.1.2.

Q. Section R111.2 "Temporary Connection." Refer to Section 15.04.070, Section 112.2.

R. Section R112 "Board of Appeals" is amended as follows:

The Local Appeals Board, the Housing Appeals Board and the Board of Appeals shall be
synonymous with the Board of Appeals in Section 15.04.070, Section 113.

S. Section R113.5 "Authority to Condemn Building Service Equipment" is hereby added; refer
to Section 15.04.070, Section 114.

T. Section R113.6 "Connection after Order to Disconnect" is hereby added; refer to Section
15.04.070, Section 114.6.

U. Section 115 "Unsafe structures and equipment" is hereby added; refer to Section 15.04.070,
Section 116. (Ord. 1800 § 2,2013)

15.04.090 Work exempt from permits.

Chapter 1, subsection 105.2/R105.2, "Work Exempt from Permits," of the 2013 California
Building Code and California Residential Code is amended as follows:

105.2/R105.2 Work Exempt from Permits: Exemptions from permit requirements of this Code
shall not be deemed to grant authorization for any work to be done in any matter in violation of
the provisions of this Code or any other laws or ordinances of the City of Oroville. Permits shall
not be required for the following:

Building:

a) One-story detached accessory structures used as tool and storage sheds, playhouses and
similar uses, provided the floor area does not exceed 120 square feet.

b) Fences not over 7 feet in height and complying with Title 17 of the City of Oroville Zoning
Regulations.

c) Oil derricks.



d) Retaining walls that are not over 4 feet in height measure from the bottom of the footing to

the top of the wall, unless supporting a surcharge or impounding Class I, II, or IIIA liquids.

e) Water tanks supported directly on grade if the capacity does not exceed 5,000 gallons and

the ratio of height to diameter or width does not exceed 2:1.

f) Sidewalks and driveways not more than 30 inches above adjacent grade, and not over any

basement or story below and are not part of an accessible route.

g) Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinets, counter tops, and similar finish work.

h) Temporary motion picture, television and theater stages, sets, and scenery.

i) Prefabricated swimming pools accessory to a group R-3 occupancy that are less than 24

inches deep, do not exceed 5,000 gallons and are installed directly above grade.

j) Shade cloth structures constructed for nursery or agricultural purposes, not including service

systems.

k) Swings and other playground equipment accessory to one- and two-family dwellings.

1) Window awnings supported by an exterior wall that do not project more than 54 inches from

the exterior wall and do not require additional support of Groups R-3 and U occupancies.

m) Non-fixed and movable fixtures, cases, racks, and counters and partitions not over 5 feet 9

inches in height.

(Ord. 1800 §2,2013)

Chapter 15.08 BUILDING CODE

15.08.010 Title and purpose.

A. This chapter shall be known and cited as the "City of Oroville Building Code" (hereinafter

referred to as "Code").

B. The purpose of this Code is to provide minimum standards to safeguard life, limb, health,

property and public welfare by regulating and controlling the design, construction, installation,

quality of materials, use and occupancy, and location of all buildings and structures within this
jurisdiction, and certain equipment specifically regulated herein. Exception: Group R-3 and U

occupancies as classified in Section 1.1.3 of the California Residential Code. (Ord. 1800 § 2,

2013)

15.08.020 Adoption of the California Building Code.

The 2013 California Building Code, Title 24, Part 2, of the California Code of Regulations, a
portion of the California Building Standards Code as defined in the California State Health and

Safety Code Sections 17922 and 18901 et seq. (hereinafter referred to as the "Building Code"),

and any rules and regulations promulgated pursuant thereto, including Building Code Appendix C
(Group U Agricultural Buildings), Appendix H (Signs), Appendix I (Patio Covers), and Appendix

J (Grading), are hereby adopted and incorporated by reference herein. Except as otherwise

provided by this chapter and Chapters 15.04 and 15.12 of the City of Oroville Municipal Code,

all construction, alteration, moving, demolition, repair and use of any building or structure within



this jurisdiction shall be made in conformance with the Building Code and any rules and
regulations promulgated pursuant thereto. (Ord. 1800 § 2, 2013)

15.08.030 Definitions.

As used in this chapter, the word "Code" means the City of Oroville Building Code. (Ord. 1800 §
2, 2013)

15.08.040 Building Code amended and added.

A. Section 105.2, "Work Exempt from Permits." Refer to Section 15.04.090, Section 105.2.

B. Section 1510.1.1 is hereby added to the California Building Code to read as follows:

1510.1.1 Re-roofing means the replacement of 25% or more of the existing roof area of a
structure over any 12-month period.

C. Section 3109 is hereby added to the Building Code to read as follows:

3109.2. Swimming Pool Enclosures and Safety Devices: A swimming pool, as defined in Section
115921 of the California Health and Safety Code, shall be permanently walled or fenced so as to

prevent uncontrolled access by children from a street or adjacent properties. The enclosure shall
be in compliance with Section 115921, 115922 and 115925 of the California Health and Safety
Code, also known as the Swimming Pool Safety Act. This enclosure shall be installed prior to
filling with water.

(Ord. 1800 §2,2013)

15.08.050 Amendments, deletions and additions to Health and Safety Code Sections 115921,115922
and 115925 (also known as the Swimming Pool Safety Act).

A. Section 115921(a) is hereby amended to read:

"Swimming pool" or "pool" means any structure intended for swimming or recreational bathing
that contains water over 18 inches deep. "Swimming pool" includes in-ground and above-ground
structures and includes, but is not limited to, hot tubs, spas, portable spas, and non-portable
wading pools.

B. Section 115921 (c) is hereby amended to read:

"Enclosure" means a fence, wall building wall or combination thereof, which completely

surrounds the pool and obstructs access to the pool.

C. Section 115922 is hereby amended to read:

Commencing on January 1, 2007, except as provided in Section 115925, whenever a building
permit is issued for construction of a new swimming pool or spa, or any building permit is issued
for remodeling a pool or spa, at a private, single family home, the pool shall be isolated from

access from other properties by an enclosure that meets the requirements of Section 115923. The
pool or spa shall also be equipped with at least one of the following 4 drowning prevention safety
features:

(1) The pool shall be isolated from access to the dwelling by an enclosure meeting the
requirements of Section 115923.



(2) The pool shall be equipped with an approved safety pool cover that meets all the
requirements of the ASTM Specifications F 1346.

(3) The residence shall be equipped with exit alarms on those doors providing direct access to
the pool mounted a minimum of 54 inches in height above floor level.

(4) All doors providing direct access from the home to the swimming pool shall be equipped
with a self-closing, self-latching device with a release mechanism (door knob or handle) placed
no lower than 54 inches above the floor.

Prior to filling any pool with water of permitted construction or remodeling work, the local
building code official shall inspect the drowning safety prevention devices required by this act
and if no violations are found shall give approval.

D, California Health and Safety Code Section 115923(e) is amended as follows:

An outside surface free of protrusions, cavities or other physical characteristics that would serve
as handholds or footholds that could enable a child below the age of five years to climb over.
Horizontal members shall be spaced at least 48 inches apart. Chain link may be used provided
that openings are not greater than 1-3/4 inches measured horizontally.

(Ord. 1800 §2,2013)

Chapter 15.12 RESIDENTIAL CODE

15.12.010 Title and purpose.

A. This chapter shall be known and cited as the "Oroville Residential Code" (hereinafter

referred to as "Code").

B. The purpose of the Code is to provide minimum standards to safeguard life, limb, health,
property and public welfare by regulating and controlling the design, construction, installation,
quality of materials, use, and location of all one- and two-family dwellings, townhouses and
accessory structures as classified in Section 1.1.3 of the Residential Code. (Ord. 1800 § 2, 2013)

15.12.020 Adoption of the California Residential Code.

The 2013 California Residential Code, Title 24, Part 2.5, of the California Code of Regulations, a
portion of the California Building Standards Code as defined in the California State Health and

Safety Code Sections 17922 and 18901 et seq., (hereinafter referred to as the "Residential

Code"), and any rules and regulations promulgated pursuant thereto and as defined in
California Health and Safety Code Section 18938.3, including Residential Code Appendix H

(Patio Covers), Appendix J (Existing Buildings and Structures), and Appendix K (Sound

Transmission), are hereby adopted and incorporated by reference herein. Except as otherwise

provided by this chapter and Chapters 15.04 and 15.08 of the Oroville City Code, all

construction, alteration, moving, demolition, repair, and use of any building or structure within

this jurisdiction shall be made in conformance with the Residential Code and any rules and

regulations promulgated pursuant thereto. (Ord. 1800 § 2, 2013)

15.12.030 Definitions.



As used in this chapter, the word "Code" means the City of Oroville Residential Code. (Ord.
1800 §2, 2013)

15.12.040 Residential Code amended.

A. Section R105.2, "Work Exempt from Permits." Refer to Section 15.04.090, Section R105.2.

B. Section R322 "Flood-Resistant Construction" is specifically not adopted. In lieu of Section

R322, refer to the City of Oroville flood ordinance, Chapter 15.96.

C. Sections R403.1.2, R403.1.3, and R403.1.4.2 of Chapter 4 of the California Residential

Code are amended as follows:

R403.1.2 Continuous footing in Seismic Design Categories C, DO, Dl, and D2: The braced wall

panels at exterior walls of buildings located in Seismic Design Categories C, DO, Dl, and D2
shall be supported by continuous footings. All required interior braced wall panels in buildings
with plan dimensions greater than 50ft shall also be supported by continuous footings.

R403.1.3 Seismic Reinforcing: Concrete footings located in Seismic Design Categories C, DO,

Dl, D2, as established by Table R301.2(l) shall have minimum reinforcement. Bottom

reinforcement shall be located a minimum of 3 inches clear from the bottom of the footing.

In Seismic Design Categories C, DO, Dl, and D2 where a construction joint is created between a
concrete footing and stem wall, a minimum of one No. 4 bar shall be installed not more than 4

feet on center. The vertical bar shall extend to 3 inches clear of the bottom of the footing, have a
standard hook and extend a minimum of 14 inches into the stem wall.

In Seismic Design Categories C, DO, Dl, and D2 where a grouted masonry stem wall is supported
on a concrete footing and stem wall, a minimum of one No. 4 bar shall be installed at not more

than 4 feet on center. The vertical bar shall extend 3 inches clear of the bottom of the footing and
have a standard hook.

In Seismic Design Categories C, DO, Dl, and D2 masonry stem walls without solid grout and
vertical reinforcing are not permitted.

Exception: In detached one-and-two family dwellings which are three stories or less in height and
constructed with stud bearing walls, plain concrete footings without longitudinal reinforcement
supporting walls and isolated plain concrete footings supporting columns or pedestals are
permitted.

R403.1.4.2 Seismic conditions: In Seismic Design Categories C, DO, Dl, and D2, interior
footings supporting bearing or braced walls and cast monolithically with a slab on grade shall
extend to a depth of not less than 12 inches below the top of the slab.

D. Section R907.1.1 is hereby added to the California Residential Code to read as follows:

R907.1 Re-roofing means the replacement of 25% or more of the existing roof area of a structure
over any 12-month period.

E. Section AJ102.5 "Flood Hazard Areas" is specifically not adopted. In lieu of Section R322,
refer to the City of Oroville flood ordinance. Chapter 15.96.

F. Section AJ 601.5 "Limitation of Reconstruction" is added as follows:

AJ 601.5 Limitation of Reconstruction: When the scope of work for R-3 and U Occupancies
involves the removal of 50% or more of the building within a one-year period, the project.



existing and new, shall be considered as new construction, and the entire building shall comply

with all currently adopted codes. Plan review and permit fees will be based on the valuation of the

entire project as a new structure. The criteria for determining the reconstruction of more than 50%

of a building may include the linear length of all existing walls (interior and exterior), square
footage of the building, percentage of altered construction, actual construction valuation as

determined by a California licensed appraiser or any combination of the above; any such

calculation shall be approved by the building official prior to acceptance.

(Ord. 1800 §2,2013)

Chapter 15.16 HOUSING CODE

15.16.010 Adoption of the Uniform Housing Code, 1997 Edition.

The Uniform Housing Code, 1997 Edition, as published by the International Conference of

Building Officials, is hereby adopted by reference and incorporated in this Code, except as

expressly amended or superseded by the provisions of this chapter. (Ord. 1800 § 2,2013)

15.16.020 Amendments, additions and deletions.

The following amendments, additions and deletions are made to the California Building

Code adopted by this chapter:

Subsection 1201 of the Uniform Housing Code, is hereby amended as follows:

Subsection 1201.1 Form of Appeal. Any person entitled to service under Section 1101.3 may

appeal from any notice and order or any action of the building official under this Code by filing at
the office of the building official a written appeal. A filing fee as established by the City Council

shall be submitted at the time of filing. Refer to City Code Section 15.04.070, Section 113,

(Ord. 1800 §2,2013)

Chapter 15.20 UNIFORM CODE FOR THE ABATEMENT OF DANGEROUS BUILDINGS

15.20.010 Adoption of Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings, 1997 Edition.

The Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings, 1997 Edition, as published by the

International Conference of Building Officials as a stand-alone document, is hereby adopted by
reference and incorporated in this Code, except as expressly amended or superseded by the
provisions of this chapter. (Ord. 1800 § 2,2013)

15.20.020 Amendments, additions and deletions.

The following amendments, additions, and deletions are made to the Uniform Code for the

Abatement of Dangerous Buildings adopted by this chapter:

Section 501 of the Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings, is hereby amended

as follows:



Subsection 501.1 Form of Appeal. Any person entitled to service under Section 401.3 may appeal
from any notice and order or any action of the building official under this Code by filing at the
office of the building official a written appeal. A filing fee as established by the City Council will
be submitted at the time of filing. Refer to City Code Section 15.04.070, Section 113.

(Ord. 1800 §2, 2013)

Chapter 15.24 PLUMBING CODE

15.24.010 Title and purpose.

A. This chapter shall be known and cited as the "City of Oroville Plumbing Code" (hereinafter
referred to as "Code").

B. The purpose of this Code is to provide minimum requirements and standards for the
protection of the public health, safety and welfare. (Ord. 1800 § 2,2013)

15.24.020 Adoption of the California Plumbing Code.

The 2013 California Plumbing Code, Title 24, Part 5, of the California Code of Regulations, a
portion of the California Building Standards Code, as defined in the California State Health and

Safety Code Sections 17922 and 18901 et seq. (hereinafter referred to as the "Plumbing Code"),
and any rules and regulations promulgated pursuant thereto, including Plumbing Code Appendix
Chapters A (Recommended Rules for Sizing the Water Supply System), B (Explanatory Notes on
Combination Waste and Vent Systems), D (Sizing Storm Water Drainage Systems), and I
(Installation Standards), hereinafter referred to as the "Appendix," are hereby adopted and
incorporated by reference herein. (Ord. 1800 § 2, 2013)

15.24.030 Definitions.

As used in this chapter, the word "Code" means the City of Oroville Plumbing Code. (Ord. 1800
§2,2013)

15.24.040 Amendments.

A. Sections 102.3,103.3.3, 103.4, 103.4.2, 103.4.4 and 103.5.9 of the California Plumbing
Code are amended as follows:

1. 102.3 "Board of Appeals." Refer to Section 15.04.070, Section 113.

2. 103.3.3 "Expiration." Refer to Section 15.04.070, Section 105.5.

3. 103.4 "Fees." Refer to Section 15.04.070, Section 109.1.1.

4. 103.4.2 "Expiration of Plan Review." Refer to Section 15.04.070, Section 105.3.2.

5. 103.4.4 "Fee Refunds." Refer to Section 15.04.070, Section 109.6.

6. 103.5.9 "Re-inspections." Refer to Section 15.04.070, Section 110.7.

B. Section 713.4 of the California Plumbing Code is amended as follows:



713.4 Public Sewer Availability; The public sewer may be considered as not being available
when such public sewer is not available within 200 feet (61 m) of the property line.

(Ord. 1800 §2, 2013)

Chapter 15.28 ELECTRICAL CODE

15.28.010 Title and purpose.

A. This chapter shall be known and cited as the "City of Oroville Electrical Code" (hereinafter
referred to as "Code").

B. The purpose of this Code is to provide minimum electrical system standards to safeguard
life, limb, health, property, and public welfare by regulating and controlling the design,
construction, installation, and quality of materials. (Ord. 1800 § 2,2013)

15.28.020 Adoption of the California Electrical Code.

The 2013 California Electrical Code, Title 24, Part 3, of the California Code of Regulations, a
portion of the California Building Standards Code as defined in the California State Health and

Safety Code Sections 17922 and 18901 et seq. (hereinafter referred to as the "Electrical Code"),
and any rules and regulations promulgated pursuant thereto, are hereby adopted and incorporated
by reference herein. Except as otherwise provided by Chapter 15.04 of the City of Oroville
Municipal Code, all electrical systems associated with construction, alteration, moving,
demolition, repair, and use of any building, structure or building service equipment within this
jurisdiction shall be made in conformance with the Electrical Code and any rules and regulations
promulgated pursuant thereto. (Ord. 1800 § 2, 2013)

15.28.030 Definitions.

As used in this chapter, the word "Code" means the City of Oroville Electrical Code. (Ord. 1800
§2,2013)

15.28.040 Amendments.

Section 690.4(1), "Solar Photovoltaic Roof Placement Requirements," is added as follows:

690.4(1) Solar Photovoltaic Roof Placement Requirements: Access and spacing requirements for
fire department emergency access related to solar photovoltaic modules shall adhere to the latest
edition of the Office of State Fire Marshall Solar Photovoltaic Installation Guidelines and shall be

reviewed by the City Fire Marshall and/or building official. Any modifications to the photovoltaic
installation guidelines shall be subject to review and approval by the Fire Marshall and/or
building official.

(Ord. 1800 §2, 2013)



Chapter 15.32 ENERGY CODE

15.32.010 Title and purpose.

A. This chapter shall be known and cited as the "City of Oroville Energy Code" (hereinafter
referred to as "Code").

B. The purpose of this Code is to provide minimum energy standards for energy consumption
regulations, energy efficient building practices, and establish minimum energy requirements, by
regulating and controlling the design, construction, installation, and quality of materials. (Ord.
1800 §2, 2013)

15.32.020 Adoption of the California Energy Code.

The 2013 California Energy Code, Title 24, Part 6, of the California Code of Regulations, a
portion of the California Building Standards Code as defined in the California State Health and

Safety Code Sections 17922 and 18901 et seq. (hereinafter referred to as the "Energy Code"), and
any rules and regulations promulgated pursuant thereto, are hereby adopted and incorporated by
reference herein. Except as otherwise provided by Chapters 15.04 and 15.12 of the City of
Oroville Municipal Code, all construction, alteration, moving, demolition, repair and use of any
building or structure within this jurisdiction shall be made in conformance with the Energy Code
and any rules and regulations promulgated pursuant thereto. (Ord. 1800 § 2, 2013)

Chapter 15.36 MOBILE HOME INSTALLATION STANDARDS

15.36.010 Adoption of mobile home installation standards.

The mobile home installation standards as set forth in this chapter and adopted by the City
Council of the City of Oroville shall be known as the "Mobile Home Installation Standards for

Mobile Homes" within the city. (Ord. 1800 § 2, 2013)

15.36.020 Permits.

A. Required. Permits shall be required for the installation of any mobile home within the City
of Oroville. Such permits will be issued by the building division of the city, and all required
inspections related to the permit shall be made by the building division in accordance with the
State of California regulations governing mobile home installations and the requirements of this
chapter.

B. Fees. Fees shall be as prescribed in the permit fee schedule as established by the city
council. (Ord. 1800 §2,2013)

15.36.030 Appearance.

A. All occupied mobile homes shall be skirted around their perimeter or the underside shall be
otherwise obscured with decking.

B. No structure or mobile home shall have any part of its exterior roofing or siding, which is
readily visible from adjacent or nearby properties constructed of reflective or glaring materials.



C. The exterior style of all structures and occupied mobile homes which are constructed,
reconstructed or placed in the city may be subject to the approval of the city as to the

compatibility of the mobile home with the existing structures and habitations in the
neighborhood, and any such facilities which are not compatible may be prohibited in accordance
with this law. (Ord. 1800 § 2, 2013)

15.36.040 Plans and speciflcations.

Prior to the issuance of any permit for the installation of any mobile home or the construction of
any accessory structure for the mobile home, the applicant shall submit all materials necessary to
determine the property location, location of the mobile home, and all other structures of the

property, utility locations, exterior blocking plan, and any other materials necessary for approval
and permit issuance. If conditions are such that the building official feels the need for further
review, a request for mobile home installation permits may be submitted to the development
review committee for consideration and findings. (Ord. 1800 § 2,2013)

Chapter 15.40 MECHANICAL CODE

15.40.010 Title and purpose.

A. This chapter shall be known and cited as the "City of Oroville Mechanical Code"
(hereinafter referred to as "Code").

B. The purpose of this Code is to provide minimum system standards to safeguard life, limb,
health, property, and public welfare by regulating and controlling the design, construction,
installation, quality of materials, location, operation, and maintenance or use of heating,
ventilating, cooling, refrigeration systems, incinerators, and other miscellaneous heat-producing
appliances within this jurisdiction. (Ord. 1800 § 2,2013)

15.40.020 Adoption of the California Mechanical Code.

The 2013 California Mechanical Code, Title 24, Part 4, of the California Code of Regulations, a

portion of the California Building Standards Code, as defined in the California State Health and

Safety Code Sections 17922 and 18901 et seq. (hereinafter referred to as the "Mechanical Code"),
and any rules and regulations promulgated pursuant thereto, is hereby adopted and incorporated

by reference herein. (Ord. 1800 § 2, 2013)

15.40.030 Definitions.

As used in this chapter, the word "Code" means the City of Oroville Mechanical Code. (Ord.

1800 §2, 2013)

15.40.040 Amendments.

Sections 108.0, 113.4, 114.0, 114.6 and 115.6 of the California Mechanical Code are amended as

follows:

A. 108.0 "Board of Appeals." Refer to Section 15.04.070, Section 113.



B, 113.4 "Expiration," Refer to Section 15,04.070, Section 105,5.

C, 114,0 "Fees," Refer to Section 15,04,070, Section 109,1,1.

D, 114,6 "Fee Refunds." Refer to Section 15.04.070, Section 109,6.

E, 115,6 "Reinspections." Refer to Section 15.04.070, Section 110.7, (Ord. 1800 § 2,2013)

Chapter 15.44 CALIFORNIA HISTORICAL BUILDING CODE

15.44.010 Title and purpose.

A. This chapter shall be known and cited as the "City of Oroville Historical Building Code"
(hereinafter referred to as "Code"),

B, The purpose of this Code is to provide minimum standards to safeguard life, limb, health,
property and public welfare by regulating and controlling the design, construction, installation,
quality of materials, use and occupancy, location of all historical buildings and structures within
this jurisdiction, and certain equipment specifically regulated herein. (Ord. 1800 § 2, 2013)

15.44.020 Adoption of the California Historical Building Code.

The 2013 California Historical Building Code, Title 24, Part 8, of the California Code of
Regulations, a portion of the California Building Standards Code as defined in the California
State Health and Safety Code Sections 17922 and 18901 et seq. (hereinafter referred to as the

"Historical Building Code"), and any rules and regulations promulgated pursuant thereto,

including Historical Building Code Appendix A (hereinafter referred to as the "Appendix"), are

hereby adopted and incorporated by reference herein. Except as otherwise provided in Chapter
15.04 of the Oroville City Code, all construction, alteration, moving, demolition, repair, and use

of any historical building or structure within this jurisdiction shall be made in conformance with
the Historical Building Code and any rules and regulations promulgated pursuant thereto, (Ord.

1800 §2, 2013)

Chapter 15.48 CALIFORNIA EXISTING BUILDING CODE

15.48.010 Title and purpose.

A, This chapter shall be known and cited as the "City of Oroville Existing Building Code"
(hereinafter referred to as "Code").

B. The purpose of this Code is to provide minimum standards to safeguard life, limb, health,
property and public welfare by regulating and controlling the design, construction, installation,
quality of materials, use and occupancy, and location of all existing buildings and structures
within this jurisdiction, and certain equipment specifically regulated herein. (Ord. 1800 § 2,2013)

15.48.020 Adoption of the California Existing Building Code.



The 2013 California Existing Building Code, Title 24, Part 10, of the California Code of

Regulations, a portion of the California Building Standards Code as defined in the California
State Health and Safety Code Sections 17922 and 18901 et seq. (hereinafter referred to as the
"Existing Building Code"), and any rules and regulations promulgated pursuant thereto, including
Existing Building Code Appendix A1 (Seismic Strengthening Provisions for Unreinforced
Masonry Bearing Wall Buildings), are hereby adopted and incorporated by reference herein. All

construction, alteration, moving, demolition, repair and use of any existing building or structure
within this jurisdiction shall be made in conformance with the Existing Building Code and any
rules and regulations promulgated pursuant thereto. (Ord. 1800 § 2, 2013)

Chapter 15.52 CALIFORNIA REFERENCED STANDARDS CODE

15.52.010 Title and purpose.

A. This chapter shall be known and cited as the "City of Oroville Referenced Standards Code"
(hereinafter referred to as "Code").

B. The purpose of this Code is to provide minimum standards to safeguard life, limb, health,
property and public welfare by regulating and controlling the design, construction, installation,
quality of materials, use and occupancy, and location of all buildings and structures within this
jurisdiction, and certain equipment specifically regulated herein. (Ord. 1800 § 2,2013)

15.52.020 Adoption of the California Referenced Standards Code.

The 2013 California Referenced Standards Code, Title 24, Part 12, of the California Code of

Regulations, a portion of the California Building Standards Code as defined in the California
State Health and Safety Code Sections 17922 and 18901 et seq. (hereinafter referred to as the
"Referenced Standards Code"), and any rules and regulations promulgated pursuant thereto,
including all appendix chapters, are hereby adopted and incorporated by reference herein. All
construction, alteration, moving, demolition, repair and use of any building or structure within
this jurisdiction shall be made in conformance with the Referenced Standards Code and any rules
and regulations promulgated pursuant thereto. (Ord. 1800 § 2,2013)

Chapter 15.56 CALIFORNIA GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS CODE

15.56.010 Title and purpose.

A. This chapter shall be known and cited as the "City of Oroville Green Building Standards
Code" (hereinafter referred to as "Code").

B. The purpose of this Code is to provide minimum standards for Green Building construction
by regulating and controlling the design, construction, installation, quality of materials, use and
occupancy, and location of all buildings and structures within this jurisdiction, and certain
equipment specifically regulated herein. (Ord. 1800 § 2, 2013)

15.56.020 Adoption of the California Green Building Standards Code.



The 2013 California Green Building Standards Code, Title 24, Part 11, of the California Code of

Regulations, a portion of the California Building Standards Code as defined in the California

State Health and Safety Code Sections 17922 and 18901 et seq, (hereinafter referred to as "Green
Building Standards Code"), and any rules and regulations promulgated pursuant thereto, is hereby
adopted and incorporated by reference herein. (Ord. 1800 § 2, 2013)

Chapter 15.60 FIRE CODE

15.60.010 Purpose.

The purpose of this chapter is to adopt by reference the 2013 edition of the California Fire

Code based on the 2012 International Fire Code, Title 24 of the California Code of Regulations,
subject to the definitions, clarifications, and the amendments set forth in this chapter. The intent
of this Code is to regulate and govern the safeguarding of life and property from fire and
explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling and use of hazardous substances, materials

and devices, and from conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of buildings and
premises in the City of Oroville. This chapter is adopted under the authority of Government
Code Section 50022.2 and Health and Safety Code Section 18941.5. (Ord. 1802 § 2, 2013)

15.60.020 Adoption of California Fire Code.

The California Fire Code, 2013 edition, including appendix chapters, is hereby adopted as the
Fire Code of the City of Oroville, regulating and governing the safeguarding of life and property
from fire and explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling and use of hazardous

substances, materials and devices, and from conditions hazardous to life or property in the
occupancy of buildings and premises as herein provided; providing for the issuance of permits
and collection of fees therefor; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties,
conditions and terms of said Fire Code on file in the office of the City of Oroville are hereby
referred to, adopted, and made a part thereof, as if fully set out in this chapter, with the additions,
insertions, deletions, and changes prescribed in Section 15.60.040. (Ord. 1802 § 2,2013)

15.60.030 Amendments to the California Fire Code.

The following amendments are hereby made to the California Fire Code:

A. Section 105.3.3 is deleted and replaced with the following:

Section 105.3.3. No final inspection by the building official as to all or any portion of a
development shall be deemed complete, and no certificate of occupancy or temporary certificate
of occupancy shall be issued unless and until the installation of the prescribed fire protection
facilities and access ways have been completed and approved by the Fire Chief, or the Chiefs

designee.

B. Section 105.8 is added to read as follows:

Section 105.8. Fees and Special Requirements. The fees for the permits and other services shall
be as established by resolution of the Oroville City Council. The fee shall be set to cover the cost

of the Fire Department to review and inspect the intended activities, operations or functions. The



fees must be paid to the City of Oroville prior to engaging in the listed activities, operations or
functions.

C. Section 302 is amended by adding the following definition:

Fireworks. Any composition or device for the purpose of producing a visible or audible effect for
entertainment purposes by combustion, deflagration, detonation or any fireworks including "safe
and sane" as defined by Section 12529 of the State of California Health and Safety Code.

D. Section 315.1 is amended by adding the following exception to read as follows:

Section 315.1 General. Storage, use, and handling of miscellaneous combustible materials shall
be in accordance with this section. A permit shall be obtained in accordance with Section 105.6.

Exception: Storage of combustible materials other than motorized vehicles or vessels shall not be

permitted in a public parking garage or in a garage or carport serving a Group R, I Occupancy,
unless the method of storage is approved by the Fire Code Official.

E. Sections 319.1 through 319.7 are added to read as follows:

Section 319.1 General. The manufacture of all fireworks, as defined in Section 302, is prohibited.

Section 319.2 Safe & Sane Fireworks, Permit to Sell. It shall be unlawful for any person to sell
fireworks within the City without having first applied for and received a permit to sell safe and
sane fireworks issued by the City Fire Department.

Section 319.2.1 Prerequisites to issuance of Permit. No permit to sell safe & sane fireworks shall
be issued to any applicant unless:

1. He/she has first obtained a permit from the state fire marshal, and

2. He/she has first obtained a business license from the City.

Section 319.2.2 Permit and clean-up fee. The permit fee for the sale of safe & sane fireworks
within the City shall be established by resolution of the City Council, payable to the City at the
Office of the City Clerk. In addition to the permit fee, each location shall pay a clean-up fee
established by resolution of the City Council, which shall be used to defray the cost of cleaning
up and disposing of expended fireworks in the City.

Section 319.2.3 Application for permit. Application for a permit to sell safe & sane fireworks
shall be made in writing to the Fire Department on or prior to the second Tuesday in March of
each year, setting forth the proposed location, and accompanied by a statement that if a permit is
issued to the applicant, the applicant shall at the time of receipt of such permit deliver to the City
Clerk a Certificate of Insurance showing the existence of a $1 million public liability insurance
policy naming the City as an additional insured.

Section 319.2.3.1 Qualifications. No permit to sell safe & sane fireworks shall be issued except as
follows:

1. To a holder of a regular business license whose principal place of business is located within
the City.

2. To a nonprofit association or corporation primarily for veteran, patriotic, welfare, civic
betterment, charitable youth purposes, and each such organization must have its principal and
permanent meeting place within the City and must have been organized and established in the
City for a minimum of one year continuously preceding the filing of the application for permit
and must have a bona fide membership of at least 20 members.



3. Applicants returning from the previous year may have first priority in the application
process.

Section 319.2.3.2 Notification. Applicants for any such permit shall be notified by the Fire Chief,
or the Fire Chiefs designee, as to the granting or rejection of application for permit on or prior to
the first Monday in May of each calendar year.

Section 319.3 Operators of fireworks stands. Operators of fireworks stands shall be subject to the
following provisions:

1. No person other than the permittee organization shall operate the stand for which the permit
is issued, or share or otherwise participate in the profits of the operation of such stand.

2. No person other than the individuals, who are members of the permittee organization, or the
wives or husbands or adult children of such members, shall sell or otherwise participate in the
sale of fireworks at such stand.

Section 319.4 Temporary fireworks stands. Temporary fireworks stands shall be subject to the
following provisions:

1. No fireworks stand shall be located within 75 feet of any existing building or within 100 feet
of any gas station.

2. Fireworks stands need not comply with the provisions of the building code of the City,
provided, however, that all stands be erected under the supervision of the building inspector who
shall require that stands be constructed in a manner which will reasonably insure the safety of
attendants and patrons.

3. No stand shall have a floor area in excess of 200 square feet.

4. Each stand in excess of 20 feet in length must have at least two exits, and each stand in
excess of 40 feet in length must have at least three exits spaced approximately equidistant apart,
provided, however, that in no case shall the distance between exits exceed 24 feet.

Section 319.5 General requirements for permittees. Permittees shall meet the following general
requirements:

1. Each stand shall be provided with two water-type fire extinguishers, each having a two and
one-half gallon capacity, being in good working order and easily accessible for use in case of fire.

2. All weeds and combustible material shall be cleared from the location of the stand, including
a distance of at least 20 feet surrounding the stand.

3. "No Smoking" signs shall be prominently displayed on the fireworks stand or wherever
fireworks are for sale.

4. Each stand must have an adult in attendance and in charge thereof when the stand is being

used for the sale or dispensing of fireworks.

5. The sale of fireworks shall not begin before 12:00 noon on the 28th day of June and shall not
continue after 12:00 midnight on the 4th day of July.

6. All unsold stock and accompanying litter shall be removed from the City by 12:00 noon on
the 10th of July. Proof of removal must be furnished to the City's Fire Department.

7. The fireworks stand shall be removed from the temporary location by 12:00 noon on the
10th day of July, and all accompanying litter shall be cleared from such location by such time and
date.



Section 319.6 Number of permits. The maximum number of permits issued pursuant to this

chapter during any one calendar year shall not exceed one license for each 1,500 residents of the

City. In determining the City population for the purposes of this section, the most recent census
calculations shall be used.

Section 319.7 Seizure. The Fire Chief or the Fire Chiefs designee shall seize, remove, or cause to
be removed at the expense of the owner all stocks of illegal fireworks offered or exposed for sale,

stored, discharged or held in violation of this Code.

F. Section 503.2.1 is deleted and replaced to read as follows:

Section 503.2.1 Dimensions. Fire Apparatus access drives shall have an unobstructed width of not

less than the following dimensions (including two 2' shoulders):

Residential Width

One-way access drive:

1 —2 Units 16 feet (12 feet paved)

Two-way access drives:

3—10 Units 20 feet (16 feet paved)

11—60 Units 25 feet (21 feet paved)

Over 60 Units 30 feet (26 feet paved)

Nonresidentiai Width

One-way access drive: 16 feet (fully paved)

Two-way access drive: 25 feet (fully paved)

The minimum unobstructed vertical clearance shall be 14 feet at all points across the required
width of the access drive. Vertical clearance may be increased as determined necessary by the

Fire Chief or the Chiefs designee.

G. Section 503.2.7 is deleted and replaced to read as follows:

Section 503.2.7 Grade. The gradient for a fire apparatus access road shall not exceed a grade of
16%, except that one run of the one hundred (100) feet or less in length may be at 18% grade
upon approval of the Fire Chief.

H. Section 503.3 is amended by adding Section 503.3.1 to read as follows:

Section 503.3.1 Fire Lane Designation. Designation of fire lanes shall be by one of the following
means:

I. By a white sign measuring at least 12 inches by 18 inches (12" x 18") posted immediately
adjacent thereto and clearly visible. It should clearly state, in red letters not less than one inch (1")
in height, that the space is a fire lane and parking is prohibited.

2. By outlining and hash marking the area in contrasting colors clearly marking it with the
words "Fire Lane - No Parking."

3. By identifying the space with a red curb upon which the words "Fire Lane - No Parking" are
stenciled every 15 feet.



A. Both sides of fire lanes shall be red curbed when the fire lane is twenty (20) to twenty-eight
(28) feet in width.

B. At least one side of a fire lane shall be red curbed and stenciled when the fire lane is over

twenty-eight (28) and up to thirty-six (36) feet in width.

C. Curbs need not be painted red nor stenciled when the fire lane is more than thirty-six (36)
feet in width.

I. Section 505.1 is deleted and replaced to read as follows:

Section 505.1 Address numbers. New and existing buildings shall have approved address
numbers, building numbers, or approved building identification placed in a position that is plainly
legible and visible from the street or road fronting the property. These numbers shall contrast with
their background. Address numbers shall be Arabic numerals or alphabet letters. Said numbers
shall be either internally or externally illuminated in all new construction. Numbers shall be as
follows:

1. Minimum of one-half-inch (112") stroke by two and one-half inches (2-1 /2") high.

2. When the structure is thirty-six (36) to fifty (50) feet from the street or fire department
access, a minimum of one-half inch (1/2") stroke by six inches (6") high is required.

3. When the structure is more than fifty (50) feet from the street or fire apparatus access, a
minimum of one-half inch (1/2") stroke by nine inches (9") high is required.

4. Where multiple addresses are required at a single driveway, they shall be mounted on a
single post, and additional signs shall be located at locations where driveways divide.

5. Where a roadway provides access to solely a single commercial or industrial business, the
address sign shall be placed at the nearest road intersection providing access to that site.

J. Sections 505.1.1 and 505.1.2 are added to read as follows:

Section 505.1.1 Multi-Tenant Buildings. Numbers or letters shall be designated on all
occupancies within a building. Size shall be one-quarter-inch (1/4") stroke by two inches (2")
high and on a contrasting background. Directional address numbers or letters shall be provided.
Said addresses or numbers shall be posted at a height no greater than 5 feet, 6 inches (5' 6") above
the finished floor and shall be either internally or externally illuminated in all new construction.

Section 505.1.2 Rear Addressing. Approved numbers or addresses shall be placed on all new and
existing buildings in such a position as to be plainly visible and legible from the fire apparatus
road at the back of a property or where rear parking lots or alleys provide an acceptable vehicular
access. Number stroke and size shall comply with Section 505.1.

K. Section 506.1 is deleted and replaced to read as follows:

Section 506.1 Where Required. Where access to or within a structure or an area is restricted

because of secured openings or where immediate access is necessaiy for life-saving or fire-
fighting purposes, the fire code official is authorized to require a key box to be installed in an
approved location. The key box shall be of an approved type and shall contain contents as
established in Section 506.1.1.1.

L. Sections 506.1.1.1 and 506.1.1.2 are added to read as follows:

Section 506.1.1.1 Key box contents requirements. The key provided shall be a master key to all

spaces including multi-tenant spaces. Additional keys shall be included for elevator control, fire



alarm control panels, and fire sprinkler control valve access. In addition, when required by the

Chief, a current copy of the Hazardous Materials Inventory Statement (HMIS) shall be kept
within the key box.

EXCEPTION: Multi-tenant spaces which provide a key box for each tenant and installed per

Section 506.1. Electronic card keys and codes may not be utilized as a substitute for manual keys.

EXCEPTION: When electronic locks release upon loss of electrical power, a manual key need

not be provided.

Section 506.1.1.2 Installation Location. When key boxes are required by the Fire Chief, such

boxes shall be mounted at 72 inches above finished floor within five feet of the latching side of

the main entrance to a structure or facility. In addition, a decal shall be provided and installed

adjacent to the key lock/latching device.

M. Section 506.2.1 is added to read as follows:

Section 506.2.1 Hazardous Materials Inventoiy Statements (HMIS). The operator of the building
shall update and maintain HMIS as required by the Fire Code Official.

N. Section 509.1.1 is added to read as follows:

Section 509.1.1. Utility Identification. In multi-unit commercial and residential buildings, gas and

electric meters, service switches and shut-off valves shall be clearly and legible marked to

identify the unit or space that it serves.

0. Section 903.3.1.4 is added to read as follows:

Section 903.3.1.4 Inspectors Test Valves. Inspector Test Valves shall be provided for each system

and located the furthest point away from the sprinkler riser.

P. Section 5003.6.1 is added to read as follows:

Section 5003.6.1 Requirements. Two NFPA 704 diamonds shall be placed on buildings so that

they are clearly visible from at least two directions of travel.

1. The signs shall be at least fifteen inches by fifteen inches (15" x 15"). The signs shall not be
placed on windows.

2. When NFPA 704 diamonds are required for the interior doors, the signs shall be applied to

the doors at a level no higher than the doorknob. The signs for the interior doors shall be at least

six inches by six inches (6" x 6").

3. The Fire Code Official may require fewer or more NFPA diamonds if the building

configuration or size make it reasonably necessary.

Q. Section A 101.1 is amended by adding the following:

Section A101.1.1 Application. The application for appeal shall be filed on a form obtained from

the City building official within 20 days after the notice was served. A filing fee, as established
by resolution of the City Council, shall be submitted at the time of filing.

(Ord. 1802 §2, 2013)

15.60.040 Express findings.

As required by Health and Safety Code Sections 17958.7, 18941.5(c) and 18942, the city council
hereby expressly finds that amendments to the codes adopted by this chapter and as described in



this section are necessary for the protection of the public health, safety and welfare, due to the
local climatic, geological or topographical conditions.

A. Express Finding Number 1—Climatic.

Climate is one of the greatest impacts to fire behavior and other major emergency events because
it cannot be controlled. The drying out of wood shakes and wild land fuels in the summer months
allows for easy ignition. The combustible weeds on vacant urban lots coupled with windy
conditions are a recipe for disaster. The Greater Oroville region has extreme variations in weather
patterns. Summers are arid and warm; winters are cool to freezing, but void of significant
snowfall. Fall and spring can bring any combination of weather pattern together. The doubling of
average rainfall called an "El Nino" event has occurred from time to time and does cause the

grass to mature and grow in excess of 6 feet high before it dries out. Ten square feet of this type
of fuel is equivalent to the explosive force of one gallon of gasoline. Average yearly rainfall for
the city is approximately 27 inches. This rainfall normally occurs from October to April. Low-
level fog (tulle-fog) is present throughout the winter months, which brings visibility to almost
zero feet. The fog delays emergency responders. The fog can also cause freezing and slick
roadways. During the summer months there is generally no measurable precipitation.
Temperatures for this dry period range from 70 to 112 degrees F and are frequently accompanied
by light to gusty Delta winds. The relative humidity during the summer months range from 2 to
30 mm Hg, which is classified as arid.

B. Express F inding Number 2—Geological.

The City of Oroville is subject to ground tremors from seismic events as the city is located in
Design Category C, which relates to a high risk of earthquakes. Gas appliances located in attics or
garages must be adequately braced and protected from damage from moving objects. Large
portions of the city have poor soil conditions. Additionally, the very low elevations are subject to
a very high water table.

C. Express Finding Number 3—^Topographical.

The city features include open space, drainage canals, components of the Oroville Dam and its
water handling systems, highways and railroad tracks. Traffic has to be channeled around several
of these topographical features and limitations which create traffic congestion and delays in
emergency response. These features are located between the Fire Station located within the city
and our Automatic Aid partners CalFire and El Medio. Heavy traffic congestion on the city
streets already acts as a barrier to timely response for fire and emergency vehicles. In the event of
an accident or other emergency at one of the key points of intersection between a road and

freeway, sections of the city could be isolated or response times could be sufficiently slowed so
as to increase the risk of injury or damage. (Ord. 1802 § 2, 2013)

Chapter 15.64 MISCELLANEOUS PROVISIONS

15.64.010 Uniform Sign Code.

The Uniform Sign Code is not adopted. (Ord. 1800 § 2, 2013)

15.64.020 Uniform Code for Building Conservation.



The Uniform Code for Building Conservation is not adopted. (Ord. 1800 § 2, 2013)

15.64.030 Permits and state license requirements.

"To whom permits may be issued" is deleted. (Ord. 1800 § 2,2013)

15.64.040 Construction value schedule.

The construction valuation schedule shall be that fee schedule established by the city council fee

resolution. (Ord. 1800 § 2,2013)

15.64.050 Violations and penalties.

Any person, firm or corporation violating any of the provisions of this division shall be guilty of
an infraction and upon conviction thereof shall be punished by a fine of not more than the amount
outlined in the Master Fee Schedule. (Ord. 1800 § 2,2013)



SECTION 3: The City Clerk shall attest to the adoption of this ordinance and cause same to be
published in the manner required by the City Charter.

This ordinance shall take effect on the 30'^ day after its adoption.

First Reading Passed by the Oroville City Council at a meeting of November 5, 2019.

Adopted by the Oroville City Council at a meeting of December 3, 2019 by the following vote:

AYES: Council Members Draper, Goodson, Hatley, Pittman, Smith, Vice Mayor

NOES:

ABSTAIN:

ABSENT:

Thomson, Mayor Reynolds

None

None

None

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

Scott E. Huber, City Attorney

Chj#^ Mayor

ATTEST: [)-fCfmber

Ja^ie Glover, Asst. City Clerk


